
RESOLUTION 2005 -
84 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING RESOLUTION 2005-76, WHICH 
ESTABLISHED AN EMERGENCY RELATING TO THE NASSAU 
AMELIA UTILITIES 
ADMINISTRATOR TO 

AND AUTHORIZED 
ISSUE A NOTICE TO 

COASTLINE UTILITY CONTRACTORS, INC. 

THE COUNTY 
PROCEED TO 

WHEREAS, the Nassau Amelia Utilities ("NAU") Manager 

has advised the County Administrator of additional work 

that must be performed based upon the original emergency as 

set forth in Resolution 2005-76; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners adopted 

Resolution 2005-76, which established an emergency related 

to Nassau Amelia Utilit s ("NAU"); and 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners authorized 

a Purchase Order in an amount up to $90,000.00; and 

WHEREAS, the NAU Manager has advised the County 

Administrator of an additional cost of $5,846.96 that is 

necessary to address the work pursuant to the emergency; 

and 

WHEREAS, the County Administrator concurs that the 

additional cost of $5,846.96 is necessary and is part of 

the emergency previously declared in Resolution 2005-76; 

and 

WHEREAS, the NAU Manager notified the County 

Administrator of the amount on May 4, 2005. 
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NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED this 11 th day of May, 

2005, by the Board of County Commissioners of Nassau 

County, Florida, that: 

1. The Board of County Commissioners hereby amends 

Resolution 2005-76 to authorize an additional amount up to 

$10,000.00. 

2 • The Board hereby authorizes the County 

Administrator to obtain a Purchase Order in the amount of 

$5,846.96. 

3. The Board hereby authorizes the County 

Administrator and the Manager of Nassau Amelia Utilities to 

notify Coastline Utility Contractors, Inc., of.the approval 

of the amount of $5,846.96. 

4. A copy of this Resolution shall be provided to 

the Clerk. 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
NASSAU COUNTY, FLORIDA 
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Approved as to form by the 
Nassau County Attorney 

z/amyers/res/nau-emergency-apr-2005-3 
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Lisa Gregory 

From: Yvonne Thomas · 

Sent: Tuesday, May 10,200.5 5:03 PM 

To: . . Lisa Gregory 

Cc: . Michael Mahaney 

Subject: Proposal for Coastline Utiltity 
. . . ' . . . . . 

Utility Manager recommendation to except the proposal in the amountof $5,846.96 from Coastline 
Utility for the emergency repairs. Utility Manager has verified damage of components and recommends 
that this proposal be approved. ·. . . )..,, 

· . Doug Hewett ··vr i.Jfo ·. Utility Manager 
Nassau-Amelia Utiltities 
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Coastline Utility. 
Contractors,· Inc. 

. Doug: 

·...._ .. ~ 
10745 Alta Drive 

J.acksonville,.Florida 
112226 

Underground Utlllty & 
.Excavation 
Contractors 

Lie.# CUCJD887l 
Phone: (904) 4?.5 • 4086 
Pu.: (904) 4211 • 4086 . 

Proposal 
To: 

From: 
Date: 
Subject: 

Dotig S. B:ewett 
. Manager; N~ ~ Amelia Utllit:ies 
· @fax # 904,281.2548 
Billll.ellig 
May-09,2005 
All.le1ia Isl. J?py Sewer Repair 

· As You are aware we have incurred a 16" drop connectton into the existing 
recei~g manhole wbiCh 1s 1n disrepaJr due to sewer gas deterioration. As per 

· your direction, we have initiated mat.erial orders to correct this deficiency, The 
· materials will be delivered md the repair started tomonow, May 10, 2005. 

Cost for the rt1JJ1o'V'al aid replacement of tlle 16" drop connection ni as follows. 

Material: 
. l. One (l)ea.16" mJ. epoxy lined tee with accessortes ........ u ................... _, $2,038.75 

2. One (1) ea.18., m.J. epoxy lined 90 degree bend With accessones ............ $1,697.21 

. Labor & Equipment 
l. 8 hOl.lr's labor ............................. -Jt, ............................... , .............. - .............. ~ .................. $1.m00 
2. 8 hoµrs equl_pment ........... ~~ ............. , ......................................................... _.,, ................. Sl,.6"2.00 
a. 8 hours dewatering & byhpass .............................................. ~ ....... _._ .. ., .... ._ ll 7$3,00 
Total material, labor, and equi;pmenl ....................................... M ..................... $'7,846.96 

. Lea5 credit tor coring and booting manhole and pump station 

0 

· . .r:-. .... 

to.eluded :ln original pi:':lcillg ....................................................................... ; .... {$1,500,00) 

TOta1 Value For Above Work ................................... '. ............................. · ........ $5,848.96 

Please note that all conditions of contract proposal rema1U 1n full force and 81feet. 

SholJld you have any questions or require additional information please do not 
he&itate to contact 0111" office. 
ThmikYOU.. 


